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Logan McIsaac

From: Jeri Lamerton <Jeri@lamertonstrat.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 14, 2025 1:45 PM

To: Logan McIsaac

Cc: jwlamerton@gmail.com; Stryker Anderson; Bryant Beck

Subject: FW: Quotes for Trail and Pond Area Repairs

Hi Logan,  
Here is the contact information for Mike Nessan: 
 

• Big Sky Dirt Works & Excavation – Laurel,MT - mikenessan@gmail.com - (406) 670-9076, 
https://brand.site/Bigskydirtworksandexcavationhttps://brand.site/Bigskydirtworksandexcavation  

 
 

 
 

From: Stryker Anderson <sbanderson100@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, August 14, 2025 8:04 AM 

To: Jeri Lamerton <Jeri@lamertonstrat.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Quotes for Trail and Pond Area Repairs 

 

Logan, 

 

Work with Jeri and John on getting the info you need. Thanks  

 

Stryker  

 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 

From: Logan McIsaac <lmcisaac@yellowstonecountymt.gov> 

Date: Wed, Aug 13, 2025 at 10:49 AM 

Subject: RE: Quotes for Trail and Pond Area Repairs 

To: Stryker Anderson <sbanderson100@gmail.com> 

 

Stryker, 
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Can you send me their contact? I will need their COI, WC, and W9. Then I can get a contract to them and I will copy 

you and Bryant when I send that. 

  

Thank you, 

  

Logan McIsaac 

Project Manager 

C: (406) 670-0283 

D: (406) 256-6996 

www.yellowstonecountymt.gov 

lmcisaac@yellowstonecountymt.gov 

  

From: Stryker Anderson <sbanderson100@gmail.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, August 13, 2025 10:29 AM 

To: Logan McIsaac <lmcisaac@yellowstonecountymt.gov> 

Subject: Fwd: Quotes for Trail and Pond Area Repairs 

  

 

Logan, 

  

Please take a look at the quotes we have received from a contractor to do some of the work on the trails 

and ponds in the subdivision. Let me know what you think and if we can give this guy the go ahead to 

start the work. We will be going with the cheaper quote.  

  

Best, 

  

Stryker  

---------- Forwarded message --------- 

From: Jeri Lamerton <Jeri@lamertonstrat.com> 

Date: Tue, Aug 12, 2025 at 8:54 PM 
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Subject: RE: Quotes for Trail and Pond Area Repairs 

To: Stryker Anderson <sbanderson100@gmail.com> 

Cc: rusty.lohof@gmail.com <rusty.lohof@gmail.com>, jwlamerton@gmail.com 

<jwlamerton@gmail.com>, montana199@hotmail.com <montana199@hotmail.com>, 

danandbethsmith@floberg.com <danandbethsmith@floberg.com>, stevec.canak23@gmail.com 

<stevec.canak23@gmail.com>, jlamerton@wyoben.com <jlamerton@wyoben.com>, Michael Darcy 

<totemhunter@mac.com>, Bryant Beck <bryantbeck24@gmail.com> 

  

Stryker,  

Did this quote get approved by Logan?  Any timeline on when we can start the projects? 

  

 

  

From: Michael Darcy <totemhunter@mac.com>  

Sent: Saturday, August 2, 2025 4:16 PM 

To: Bryant Beck <bryantbeck24@gmail.com> 

Cc: Stryker Anderson <sbanderson100@gmail.com>; Jeri Lamerton <Jeri@lamertonstrat.com>; rusty.lohof@gmail.com; 

jwlamerton@gmail.com; montana199@hotmail.com; danandbethsmith@floberg.com; stevec.canak23@gmail.com; 

jlamerton@wyoben.com 

Subject: Re: Quotes for Trail and Pond Area Repairs 

  

I am okay moving ahead with the cheaper quote and assess his work for future projects.  

  

Mike  

Sent from my iPhone 
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On Aug 1, 2025, at 12:00 PM, Bryant Beck <bryantbeck24@gmail.com> wrote: 

 

All,  

  

I am in agreement on proceeding with these jobs.  

  

Let's submit these estimates to the county for their review, and we can note our contractor 

preference to Logan at that time.  

  

Thanks,  

Bryant  

On Fri, Aug 1, 2025, 11:24 AM Stryker Anderson <sbanderson100@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hey everyone, 

  

I think we should get John's guy to get in here and get it done. John mentioned to me he 

thinks the cheaper quote was a better individual to work with anyway. We can use him for 

the dirt clean-up and the trail tune-up next to Pond 1 & 2. If he does a good job we could 

have him do other projects around the neighborhood. Everyone in agreement? 

  

I have a message out to Logan at the county about approving this along with clarification 

on who has to maintain the grass and tree on the SW side of the intersection. There is 

discussion about improving that for better visibility at the intersection. I will let you know 

what I find out.  

  

Stryker 

  

On Wed, Jul 23, 2025 at 9:34 PM Jeri Lamerton <Jeri@lamertonstrat.com> wrote: 

Replying all because I had Steve’s email wrong again.  So sorry!   
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From: Jeri Lamerton  

Sent: Wednesday, July 23, 2025 9:33 PM 

To: sbanderson100@gmail.com; rusty.lohof@gmail.com; jwlamerton@gmail.com; 

montana199@hotmail.com; danandbethsmith@floberg.com; totemhunter@mac.com; 

steve.canak23@gmail.com; Bryant Beck <bryantbeck24@gmail.com> 

Cc: jwlamerton@gmail.com <jlamerton@wyoben.com> 

Subject: Quotes for Trail and Pond Area Repairs 

  

Hi all,  

I’m sharing, on behalf of John, two quotes for the repair work on the trail near our 
house and for leveling the dirt beside the pond.  We sent out requests to four different 
contractors and received responses from the following two: 

1. Cohesive Construction & Excavation LLC, Columbus, MT – provided by 
Tony (tony@drtman.com) {attached} 

2. Big Sky Dirt Works & Excavation, Laurel, MT – provided by Mike 
(mikenessan@gmail.com) {below} 

From: Michael Nessan <mikenessan@gmail.com> 
To: John Lamerton <JLamerton@wyoben.com> 
Subject: Re: Request for Dirt Leveling and Excavation Work – Please 
Contact Us  

  

Hello John,   

  

I came up with a quote for fixing the walking path (this would include 
bringing in some 3/4 road mix.) and leveling out the dirt piles behind 
pond one. The total for the whole thing is $1800.  

  

Thanks and let me know if you have any questions or concerns.  Mike 
Nessan.  
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Please review both quotes at your convenience and let me know when we’re ready to 
submit them to Logan for approval so we can move forward with these projects. 

Thanks, 
~Jeri 

<image001.png> 
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Logan McIsaac

From: Michael Nessan <mikenessan@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 21, 2025 2:39 PM

To: Logan McIsaac

Subject: Re: Pheasant Brook Work

Attachments: image001.png; 2025-08-21 14-22.pdf; COI - Big Sky Dirt Works & Excavation - For 

Information Purposes Only.pdf

Logan, 

 

 

 

Attached is my w-9 and insurance, i will provide my ICEC as soon as i get it. Also a summary of what i will 

be doing is there is a pile of dirt they would like spread out and a gravel walking path approximately 150 

feet long has been rutted up. I will start on that by smoothing out the ruts then bring in some fresh road 

mix and smooth that out and grade it for a smooth walking path. 

 

 

 

Thanks Mike Nessan. 

 

On Thu, Aug 21, 2025, 1:59 PM Logan McIsaac <lmcisaac@yellowstonecountymt.gov> wrote: 

Mike, 

  

Go ahead and send over your certificate of insurance, W9, and your quote to the Pheasant Brook Subdivision. 

Once I have those I will get started on the contract. 

When you do get your workers’ comp. exemption please send that. 

  

Thank you, 

  

Logan McIsaac 

Project Manager 

C: (406) 670-0283 

D: (406) 256-6996 
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www.yellowstonecountymt.gov 

lmcisaac@yellowstonecountymt.gov 

  

From: Logan McIsaac  

Sent: Thursday, August 14, 2025 1:55 PM 

To: mikenessan@gmail.com 

Subject: Pheasant Brook Work 

  

Mike, 

  

I was informed by the Ad-Hoc Board of Pheasant Brook that they want you to do some trail work for them. 

I will need to get a contract wrote up. For the contract I will need your certificate of insurance, workers’ comp, 

and W9. 

If you could send over your proposal or a brief write up specifying the work that was discussed I will include those 

details in the contract. 

Let me know if you have any questions. 

  

Thank you, 

  

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
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Your Policy DBA Frontier Insurance Solutions
848 Main Street #16
Billings, MT 59105

Your Policy DBA Frontier Insurance Solutions

(406)265-4842 (406)265-4842

kim_logan@your-policy.com

96281755-250723083710 1

Mike Nessan
DBA: Big Sky Dirt Works & Excavation
1231 5th Ave
Laurel, MT 59044
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